					
	

Freedom of Information Act Request
[bookmark: R0bd164e4dbe740bbb4bd60e1b548f6ff]
Reference: 	ECC19040412 09 25
Response:	30 September 2025

I can confirm that Essex County Council does not hold this information.

[bookmark: R7c8b99fe11674a48929d90318ab60387]Please provide details of:
1. 
1. The transport costs.
1. The escort costs.
From EN9 3JR to Passmores Academy, CM18 6JH by taxi, also specifying distance and duration of the route used.

[bookmark: _Hlk209189776]Essex County Council do not hold this information as the planning and costing of transport routes is managed solely by the transport operator
	
1. Please detail whether the above journey would be shared with other pupils.

Not applicable se Q1

1. If so, what distance and duration this would add to the journey?

Not applicable see Q1

1. How many pupils would be using this shared transport?

Not applicable see above response to Q1
	
1. [bookmark: _Hlk209189931]How will training; and the introduction of new / substitute drivers and escorts; be managed?

The training; and the introduction of new / substitute drivers and escorts; is managed solely by the operator.
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